
Republic of the Philippilres 

PHILIPPINE HEALTH INSURANCE CORPORATION 

22 December 2015 

Citystate Centre, 709 Shaw Boulevard, Pasig City 
Call Center (02) 441 -7442 Trunkline (02) 441-7444 

www.philhealth.gov.ph 

Sec. FLORENCIO B. ABAD 
Dept. of Budget and Management and Chairperson 
GOVERNMENT PROCUREMENT POLICY BOARD 
Unit 2506, Raffles Corporate Center 
F. Ortigas Jr. Road, Ortigas Center 
Pasig City 

Dear Secretary Abad: 

Greetings! 

In compliance with Section 12.2 of the Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations of Republic Act No. 

9184, Government Procurement Reform Act, we are submitting herewith the Procurement 

Monitoring Report o f Philhealth Regional Offices for the 2nd Semester of CY2015 in printed 

and electronic format. 

We hope you find everything in order. 

Very Truly Yours, 

teamphilhealth www.facebook.com/Phi iHeallh Youll!!D www.youtube.com/teamphi lhealth actioncenter@philhealth .gov.ph 
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PAP Code 

774-10 

774-10 

774-10 

774-10 

774-20 

778-00 

Procurem e nt Project 
N a m e 

Regular Office Supplies 

Regular Office Supploes 

Regular Office Supploes 

Regular Office Suppl ies 

Accountable Forms 

Medical, Dental & lilb Supploes 

-----
779-00 

785-00 

785-00 

785-00 

238-10 

238-10 

238-10 

238-10 

Drugs & Medlcon•s Expenses 

IT Supplies 

rT Supplies 

rT Supplies 

Office Equipment - 1 unot Home 

Appliance, Refrigerator 

Office Equipment - 3 unit Fan, 

Electric Fan, w/ Stand 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Vacuum 

Cleane r 

Office Equipment- 1 unit Sound 

System, Pubhc Address System 

P MO/ 
End us er 

PRO-CAR 

PRO-CAR 

PCARES 

PRO-CAR 

PRO-CAR 

PCARES 

-t 

PRO-CAR 

PRO-CAR 

PRO-CAR 

PRO-CAR 

HCDMD (Clinic) 

Abra UiiO 

ITMU 

tfugao UiiO 

Kepubltc oj lire Phrlrpprnes 

Philippine Health Insurance Corporation 
PHILHEALTH REGIONAL OFFICE- CORDILLERA ADMINISTRATIVE REGION 

SN Oriental Baguio Traders Bldg., No. 19 Leonard Wood Road, Baguio Cuy 

Tel. No. (074) 444-98621 444-8361 / 446-037 1 /444-5345 (TIF) I Call Center(02) 441-7442 

www.phrlheplth.gov.ph 

SAC-GOODS AND SERVICES 
Procu rement Monitoring Report as of September 30, 2015 

Actua l Procurem ent Activity 
Mode of 

P rocuremen t 

P5-DBM/5hopping 

Small Value 

P5-DBM/Shopping 

Pre-Proc Ads/Post 

Coof. ITB 

----
A&•ncy to A&ency 

A&•ncy to A&ency 

PS·DBM/Shopping 

Small Value 

P5-DBM/5hopplng 

Small Value 

Direct Contracting 

Small Value 

Small Value 

Small Value 

-----
Small Value 

Pre-bid 

Co of. 

Elig ib ility Sub/ Opening Bid Post- Notice of Contnct Notice to 

Check of Bids Evaluation Qual AWllrd Signing Proceed 

----------

--..-----

238-10 Office Equipment · 3 unrt Speaker, ITMU & Abra UiiO Small Value 
Cradle speaker system 

238-10 
Office Equipment - 1 unlt Camera, 

d rgrtal, SLR kit w/ lens 
ITMU Small Value 

Delivery Acceptance 

Completion Tum.-over 

9/ 30/2015 9/30/2015 

9/30/2015 9/30/2015 

9/30/2015 9/30/2015 

9/30/2015 9/ 30/2015 

9/30/2015 9/ 30/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

9/ 30/2015 9/30/2015 

3 / 30/ 2015 9/30/2015 

9/ 30/2015 9/30/ 2015 

5/ 31/2015 5/ 31/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

6/ 25/2015 6/25/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

6/25/ 2015 6/25/2015 

7/10/2015 7/10/2015 

I 



·-z.. 



Actual Procure ment Activi ty 

PAP Cod e 
Proc ure ment Project PMO/ M o de of 

Name E n d user Procure ment Pre-P roc Ads/Post Pre-bid E lig ibili ty Sub/ Ope ning Bid Post- Notice o f Contract Notice to Delivery Acceptance 

Con f. ITB Con f. C beck of Bids Evaluatio n Qua l Award Signing Proceed Completio n T um-ove r 

Procurement of Lease of Venue Phil Health Central Lease of Privately 
03/23/2015- 03/31/2013-

for the conduct of Training for Office through Owned Real Estate 
03/30/2015 

N/A 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 
04/01/2015 

4/1/2015 4/6/2015 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 
Trainers on TseKap Package PRO-CAR and Venue 

-
Procurement of Lease of Venue 

Lease of Pnvately 
for the Quality Management 04/01/2015- 04/ 08/2015-
Systems Training for PRO-CAR 

PRO-CAR Owned Real Estate 
04/08/2015 

N/A 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 
04/13/2015 

4/14/2015 4/15/2015 5/8/2015 5/8/2015 

Employees 
and Venue 

-
Procurement of Lease of Venue 

Phil Health Central Lease of Pnvately 
for the Phil Health Accounts 04/23/2015- 04/30/2015· 
Management Strategy Forum for 

Office through Owned Real Estate 
04/29/2015 

N/A 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 
05/04/2015 

5/4/2015 5/5/2015 3/7/2015 3/7/2015 
PRO-CAR and Venue 

Area 1 
-L + t + .. 

Procurement of Lease of Venue 
PhiiHealth Central Lease of Pnvately 

for the Conduct of Workshop on 05/11/2018- 05/18/2015-
the Implementation Review of All 

Office through Owned Real Estate 
05/18/2015 

N/A 5/18/2015 5/18/2015 5/18/2015 
05/20/2015 

5/22/2015 5/26/2015 

I 
5/29/2015 5/29/2015 

Case Rates 
PRO-CAR and Venue 

Procurement of Lease of Venue Lease of Privately 
08/20/2015 . 08/27/2015 -

for the Orientation of Casual PRO-CAR Owned Real Estate 
08/27/2015 

N/A 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 
08/28/2015 

8/28/2015 8/28/2015 9/2/2015 09/02-03/2015 09/02-03/2015 
Employees of PRO-CAR and Venue 

.. 
3416861 

Procurement of 1 Lot Office 
PRO-CAR Public Biddong 9/17/2015 

09/19/2015 . 
N/A 9/ 28/ 2015 9/ 28/2015 9/28/2015 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Tables and Chairs 09/28/2015 
I 

Prepared by: Recommending Approval: Approved by: 

t~ ..... ~ ELIZABET!s.· ~NDEZ, MD 

Clerk Ill BAC Chairperson \ . Regional Vice President 



Procurement Source of 

Prog ram Project RIV/ PR ABC Fu nd 

Numbcr/s Number 

PR1So()1.001, 

Recular Office Supplies 002,020,028,030,031 201S COB 
.@.._ ___ 

PR15.0HJ03, 

Recular Office Supplies 007,010,011,013,014,02 2015 COB 

2,023,032 

Recular Office Supplies PR15.02.005; 029 2015 COB 

Recular Office Supplies PR15.o9.073 2015 COB 

Accountable Forms P-15.o13,054,055 2015 COB 

Medtcal, Dental & Lab. 
PR15.02.005 2015 COB 

Supplies 

Drugs & Mediones Expenses PR15·{)l.o04 2015 COB 

IT Supplies .PR 15.01.001, 002 2015 COB 

IT Supplies PR lS.ol-003, 032 

IT Supplies PR15.03.()()6 2015 COB 

--- . 
Office Equipment · 1 untt 

RIV 15.()45 2015 COB 
Home Appliance, Refrigerator 

Office Equipment · 3 untt Fan, 
RIV 15.032 2015 COB 

Electric Fan, w/ Stand 
----

Office Equipment · 1 unit 
RIV 15.()41 2015 COB 

Vacuum Oeaner 

Office Equtpment · 1 unit 
Sound System, Public Address RIV 15.036 2015 COB 
System 

Office Equipment · 3 untt 
Speaker, Cradle speaker RIV 15.()41 & 032 2015 COB 
system 

Office Equtpment · 1 unit 
RIV P-15.()41 2015 COB 

Camera, dtgital, SLR kit wflens 

R ep11blic oftlte Philippines 

Philippine Health Insurance Corporation 
PHILHEALTH REGIONAL OFFICE - CORDILLERA ADMINISTRATIVE REGION 

SN Oriental Baguio Traders Bldg., No. 19 Leonard Wood Road, Baguio City 

Tel. No. (074) 444-98621444-8361/446-0371 / 444-5345 (Tif) I Call Center (02) 441-7442 

www philheahh.gov.ph 

BAG-GOODS AND SERVICES 

Procurement Monitoring Report as of September 30, 2015 

ABC (PhP) Contrac t Cost (PhP) 
----

Toul MOOE co 

818,65310 

1,723,261.00 1,723,261.00 842,398.50 

23,745.40 

------· 
19,043.00 19,043.00 8,415.80 8,415 80 

U,220.00 12,220.00 U,218.50 U ,218 50 

541,559.00 541,559.00 165,300.00 165,300 00 

15,162.00 15,162.00 3,578.00 3,57800 

78,462 00 78,462.00 35,603.00 35,603 00 

280,176.20 

2, 725,333 00 2,725,333.00 369,843 20 8,667 00 

81,000 00 

11,544.50 11,544.50 11,500.00 11,500.00 

3,294.00 3,294 00 3,270.00 3,270.00 

6,600.00 6,600 00 6,490.00 6,490 00 

----
27,500 00 27,500.00 27,000.00 27,000.00 

15,592.50 15,592.50 13,050.00 13,050.00 

32,989 00 32,989 00 28,609.00 28,609 00 

NAM E OF 

BIDDERS 

S ubmilll bid p roposal 

during the b id opening 

YES NO 

AMOUNT 

o f 

Bid docume nt 

I 



Proc urement Source of ABC (PhP) Contr.oct Cost (PhP) NAME OF Submits bid proposal AMOUNT 

Program Pro ject RN/ PR ABC Fund 
BIDDERS 

during the bid opening o f 
T otal MOO E co Tollll MOOE co 

Number/s Number YES NO Bid d ocument 

Office Equipment- 1 unot 
RIV P-15-046 2015 COB 60,00000 60,000.00 41,950.00 41,950.00 

Paper Shredder, heavy duty 

Office Equipment · S unit RIV P-15-
2015 COB 91,355.00 91,355 00 

Paper Shredder, heavy duty 041;0430;44,047 
46,000.00 46,000.00 

Office Equipment · 2 unot 
RIV P· lS-041 2015 COB 5,93946 5,939.46 3,300.00 

AutomatiC Voltage Re,ulator 

Office Equipment - 1 uni t 
RIV P-15-044 2015 COB 12,172.60 12,172.60 5,900.00 

laminating Machine 

Furniture & Fixture · 4 unot 
RIV 1.5-039 & 040 2015 COB 44,000.00 44,00000 44,000.00 

Storage Cabinet 
44,000.00 

[ __ 
Furniture & Fixture - 7 unit 

RIV P-15-043;044;047; 2015 COB 80,080.00 80,08000 62,860.00 62,860.00 
Fi ling Cabonet, 4-<lrawer 

Furnoture & Fucture • 2 unot 
RIV P-15.037 2015 COB 13,120.00 13,120.00 5,960.00 5,960.00 

Mobile Cabinet 
---- -- --- -

Furniture & Fixture - 4 unot 
RIV P-15.{132 2015 COB 38,720 00 38,720.00 30,720.00 30,720.00 

Steel Rack 

IT Equipment · 2 unit HOD, 
RIV P-15.{}20 2015 COB 9,000 00 5,10000 5,100.00 

SATA Hard Dtsk, l,ow capaoty 
----

IT Equopment • 2 unot Card 
Reader 

RIV P-15.{)20 2015 COB 5,000 00 5,000.00 420.00 420.00 

IT Equopment - 6 unot 
RIV P-15.023,025;027-

Communication Device, 
030 

2015 COB 29,007 00 29,007.00 9.510 00 9,510 00 

PocketWifi 

----
Procurement o f 1 Lo t 

Masangkay 

Computer Center, 
Regular IT Equipment for P-14· 119 COB 3,128,000.00 3,128,000.00 2,848,912.00 

UnkNetwo rk 
X 4,000.00 

2014 Solutions Inc 

----
Procurement of 1 Lot IT Masangkay 
Network Oevoce and IT P-14-144 COB 1,470,000.00 1,470,000.00 1, 290,484.00 

Computer Center 
X 2,000.00 

Equipment ---

J-14-145 COB 1,314,197.42 1,314,197.42 1,309,884.41 
Mountain Horizon 

Builders 
2,000.00 

....._ 

Procurement of Lease of 
El Cielito Inn, 

Venue for the conduct of P-15-016 COB 128,072.00 128,072.00 117,000.00 117,000.00 
Pooten Resort, 

X N/ A 
Rlverv1ew 

PRO-CAR Employees Day 
waterpark, Palm 



~ 
, Procurement Source of ABC (PhP) Contract Cost (PbP) N AME OF Submits hid proposal AMOUNT 

+- BIDDERS 
Program Project RIV/ PR ABC Fund 

I I 
during t&e bid opening of 

T otal MOOE co Total MOO E co 
N umbcr/s N umber 

I 
YES NO Bid document 

wrocurement 01 Lease o1 New Town Plaza 
Venue for the conduct of 

J-15-051 COB 457,076.47 457,076.47 402,000.00 402,000.00 Hotel, Forest N(A X 

+ Training for Trainors on 

1 
f odge, Le Mon~t 

TsPKao Pad<aPP l t I ... 
Procurement of Lease of 

Venue for the Quality 
New Town Plaza 

Management Systems P-15·052 COB 334,400.00 334,400.00 334,400.00 334,400.00 
Hotel, 

X N/ A 

Training for PRO-CAR 

Employees 
-r- + T 

Procurement of Lease of Chalet Baguio, · 

Venue for the PhiiHealth 
COB 247,690.00 247,690.00 198,270.00 198,270.00 

Hotel Elizabeth, 
X N/ A 

Accounts Management Newtown Plaza 

Strategy Forum for Area 1 Hotel 
... + -

Procurement of Lease of The Manor at 

Venue for the Conduct of Camp John Hay, 

Workshop on the 15-05-017A COB 325,674.03 325,674.03 289,582.08 289,582.08 Newtown, Plaza X N/A 

Implementation Review of Hotel, Bagulo 

All Case Rates Crown Legacy 

Palm Groove 
... -

Procurement of Lease of 

Venue for the Orientation 
15-08-059 COB 84,199.80 84,199.80 79,050.00 79,050.00 

Resort, Riverview 
X N/ A 

of Casual Employees of Park, Asln 

PRO-CAR + L l Hotspring Poofen 
+ + 

Procurement of 1 Lot 
15-09-076 COB 588,148.00 588,148.00 N/ A N/ A No Bidders 2,000.00 

Office Tables and Chairs I 

Prepared by: Recommending Approval: Approved by: 

CO~T ~N ~-:t. 
EliZABETH FERNANDEZ, MD 

Clerk Ill BAC Chairperson ~-Regtonal Vice President 



.. 

Procu rement Code 

Program P rojec t PAP 

Regular Office Supplies 

Regular Office Supplies 774-10 

Regular Office Supplies 774-10 

Regular Office Supplies 774-10 

----- --- -
Accountable Forms 774-20 

Medical, Dental & Lab. Supplies 778-00 

Drugs & Med1cines Expenses 779-00 

IT Supplies 785-00 

+ 
IT Supplies 785-00 

IT Supplies 785-00 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Home 
238-10 

Appliance, Refrigerator 

Office Equipment - 3 unit Fan, Electric 
238-10 

Fan, w/ Stand 

Office Equipment- 1 unit Vacuum 
Cleaner 

238-10 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Sound System, 
238-10 

Public Address System 

Office Equipment - 3 unit Speaker, 
238-10 

Cradle speaker system 

------
Office Equipment - 1 unit Camera, 

238-10 
digital, SLR kit w/lens 

rlepubu"' "J '-"e p!J,upp•nr:;, 

Philippine Health Insurance Corporation 
PHILHEALTH REGIONAL OFFICE- CORDILLERA ADMINISTRATIVE REGION 

SN Oriental Baguio Trader.; Bldg., No. 19 Leonard Wood Road, Baguio City 

Tel. No. (074) 444-9862/ 444-8361 / 446-0371 /444-5345 (TIF) I Call Cenrer (02) 441-7442 

.,...,..w,philhealth.gov.ph 

Winning Bidd er 

PS-OBM, Laser Mktg 

JC Com'l., Panghoi Enl 

PS-OBM, Laser Mktg 

National Printing Office 

qoC.O. 

PS-OBM 

PEA Drugs 

PS-DBM 

Eagle Tech; Laser Mktg; 

Xworks Sales & Services 

ESM Enterprises 

ESM Enterprises 

ESM Enterpnses 

ESM Enterprises 

SAC-GOODS AND SERVICES 
Procurement Monitoring Report as of September 30, 2015 

Lis t of 

I nvited 

Observers 

Date o f R eceipt of Invitatio n 
,---

Pre-Proc Pre-bid Eligibility Sub/Open Bid 

Conference Conference Check of Bids Evaluation 

_, __ t_ 
I 

------'-- ---

------------·-

Post-

Qual. 

Remarks 

(Expbming Chonges 

from the API') 

-----~-----1 

Change Mode of Procurement (BAC Res. # 

6, s. 2015) 

-- -------,.----- -----------

ESM Enterprises 

Mt. Studio 

I 



I., Proc urement Code List o f Date o f R eceipt o f Invitation Remarks 

Program Project PAP Winning Bidder Invited Pre-P roc Pre-bid 
------

E ligibility Sub/O~n Bid Post- (Expb.ining <lunges 

Observers Confere nce Conference Check o f Bids Evaluation Qual from !he API') 

Office Equipment- 1 unit Paper 
Laser Mktg 

Shredder, heavy duty 

Offi ce Equipment- 5 unit Paper 
Laser Mktg 

Shredder. heavy duty 

-------
Office Equipment- 2 unit Automatic 

238-10 Laser Mktg 
Voltage Regulator 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Laminating 
238-10 Laser Mktg 

Machine 

---------r-
Furniture & Fixture- 4 unit Storage 

239-00 Trl M Vault Specialist 
Cabinet 

---- - -, Furniture & Fixture - 7 unit Filing 
239-00 See Manufacturing 

Cabinet, 4-drawer 

Furnoture & Fixture- 2 unit Mobile 
239-00 See Manufacturing 

Cabinet 

Furniture & Fixture - 4 unit Steel Rack 239-00 See Manufacturing • T 

IT Equipment- 2 unit HOD, SATA Hard 
238-20 Baguio Office Systems & Solutoons 

Disk, l,ow capacity 

IT Equipment - 2 unit Card Reader 238-20 PhiLaser Marketing .. 
--- -

IT Equipment- 6 unit Communication 
238-20 PhiLaser Marketing 

Device, Pocket Wifi 

Procurement of 1 Lot Regular IT 
COA; Phil Chambers of 

Masangkay Computer Center Commerce and 12/10/2014 U /23/2014 U/23/2014 12/23/ 2014 
Equipment for 2014 

lndustry;PICPA 

------ -----
Procurement of 1 Lot IT Network Device 

COA; Phil Chambers of Bidding documents was not posted in the 

Masangkay Computer Center Commerce and 12/23/2014 12/23/2014 12/23/2014 PHILGEPS due to technical failure as 
and IT Equopment 

lndustry;PICPA certified by the PHILGEPS 
----- ----- -----

Procurement of Leasehold COA; Phil Chambers of 

Improvement of PRO-cAR, Apayao PBC Mountain Horizon Builders Commerce and 1/7/2015 1/19/2015 1/19/2015 1/ 19/2015 

and Kalinga LHIO lndustry;PICPA 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 
N/A 

Posting of RFQ in the PHILGEPS Website Is 

conduct of PRO-CAR Employees Day not required 



Procurement 

Program Pro j ect 
- ~ 

Procurement of Lease of Venue lor the 

conduct of Training lor Trainers on 

TseKap Package 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 

Quality Management Systems Training 

for PRO-CAR Employees 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 

Phil Health Accounts Management 

Strategy Forum for Area 1 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 

Conduct of Workshop on the 

Implementation Review of All Case 

Rates 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 

Orientation of Casual Employees of PRO· 

CAR 

Procurement of 1 Lot Office Tables and 

Chairs 

Prepared by: 

Code 

PAP Winning Bidder 

New Town Plaza Hotel 

New Town Plaza Hotel 

Chalet Baguio 

New Town Plaza Hotel 

Asin Hotspirng Pooten Resort 

N/A 

Lis t o f 

I nvited 

Observers 

N/A 

N/A 

N/ A 

N/A 

N/A 

COA; Ph1l Chambers of 

Commerce and 

lndustry;PICPA 

Pre-Proc Pre-bid 

Conference Conference 

9/ 17/ 2015 

Recommending Approval: 

~N 
BAC Chairperson 

D a te o f Receipt o f Invi tation 

Eligibil ity Sub/ Open Bid 

Check of B ids Evaluation 

3/31/2015 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 

4/8/2015 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 

4/30/2015 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 

5/18/2015 5/18/2015 5/18/2015 

8/27/2015 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 

9/28/2015 9/ 28/2015 9/28/ 2015 

Remarks 

Post - (Explam.ng Changes 

Qual. from the Al'l' ) 

03/31/2015· Fund Transfer. Posting of RFQ in the 

04/01/2015 PHILGEPS website Is not required 

04/08/2015 . Post ing of RFQ in the PHILGEPS Website is 

04/13/2015 not required 

04/ 30/2015· Fund Transfer Posting of RFQ in the 

05/04/2015 PHILGEPS Websi te is not reqwed 

05/18/2015· Fund Transfer. Posting of RFQ 1n the 

05/20/2015 PHILGEPS Website is not required 

08/20/2015· Posting of RFQ in the PHILGEPS Website is 

08/27/2015 not required 

N/ A 

Approved by: 

No b1ds were received hence BAC declare 

failure of biddmg. 

ELIZAB1..~ANDEZ, MD 

~ • Regional Vice President 



PAP Code I Procurement Project PMO/ Mode o f 

Name E oduser ProCUJe menr 

I 
774-10 R~gular Offlc~ Supplies PRO-CAll PS-OBM/Shopplng 

774-10 Regular Office Supplies PRO-CAR I Small Value 

774-10 Regular Office Supplies PCARES PS-OBM/Shopping 

774-10 Regular Office Supplies PRO-CAR A&ency to A&ency 

774·20 Accountable Forms PRO-CAR A&encv to A&ency 

778.00 Medical, Dental & Lab. Supplies PCARES PS·DBM/Shoppins 

779.00 Drugs & Medicines Expenses PRO-CAR Small Value 

785-00 IT Supplies PRO-CAR PS-DBM/Shopplng 

785-00 IT Supplies PRO-CAR Small Value 

785-00 IT Supplies I PRO-CAR Direct Contractu'~! 

238-10 
Office Equipment - 1 unit Home 

HCOM 0 (Clinic) 

I 
Small Value 

Appliance, Refrigerator 

238-10 
Office Equ1pment · 3 uM Fan, 

Abra LHIO I Small Value 
( lectric Fan, w/ Stand 

238·10 
Office Equipment • 1 unit Vacuum 
Oeaner 

ITMU Small Value 

238·10 
Office Equipment • 1 unit Sound 

lfugao LHIO Small Value 
System, Public Address System 

238-10 Office Equipment- 3 unot Speaker, ITMU & Abra LHIO 
Cradle speaker system 

Small Value 

. 
238·10 

Office Equipment • 1 unit Camera, 
ITMU Small Value 

dig1tal. SLR lor w/lens 

Rt!publrc of the PhrlrpptMS 

Philippine Health Insurance Corporation 
PHILHEAL TH REGIONAL OFFICE- CORDILLERA ADMINISTRATIVE REGION 

SN Oriental &guio Trader<; Bldg., No. 19 Leonard Wood Road, &guio City 

Tel. No. (074) 444·9!162/ 444-8361 / 446-0071 / 444-5345 (Tif) I Call Ccnrer (02) 441-7442 

www philhealrh .~rov.oh 

BAC-GOODS AND SERVICES 
Procurement Monitoring Report as of December 31, 2015 

~ 
-!:-::;.::;"' 

Actual P rocurement Activity 

Pre-Proc Ads/ Post Pre-bid Eligibility Sub/ O)>"ning Bid Posr · Notice of 

Co of. ITB Co of. Check o f Bids Eval uation Qual Award 

29-Jun·15 7-Jul-15 

29·Jun·l5 7-Jul-15 

I 

I 29-Jun-15 7-Ju~15 

I 

I 
( \ 

I 

I I I I 

Conrnct otice to Delivery I Acceptance 

Signing Proceed Completion Tum-over 

12/29/2015 12/29/2015 

12/29/2015 12/29/2015 

12/29/2015 12/29/2015 

12/29/ 2015 12/29/2015 

I I 12/29/2015 12/29/2015 I 

6{25{2015 6/25/2015 

12/15/2015 12/15/2015 

12/29/2015 12/29/2015 

12/29/2015 12/29/2015 

I 12/29/2015 12/29/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

I 
6/25/2015 6/25/2015 

I 6/25/2015 6/25/ 2015 

I 

I 7/10/2015 7{10/2015 



Actual Procuremen t Activity 

PAP Cod e 
Procurement Project PMO/ Mode of 

Bid I Notice to j Name Enduser Procuiement Pre-P roc A d s/Post I Pre-b id E lig ibility Sub /Opening Post - Notice o f Contract Delivery Accep tance 

Conf. ITB Conf. Check of Bids Evaluatio n 1 Q ual Award Signing Proceed Completion TUID-over 

238-10 
Office Equipment - 1 unit Paper 

AQAS SmaH Value 5/ 29/2015 6/5/ 2015 I I I 7/15/ 2015 7/ 15/ 2015 Shredder, heavy duty 

Office Equipment - 5 unit Paper 
fMS, 

238·10 ASS,BAS,ORVP, Small Value 5/ 29/ 2015 6/ 5/ 2015 7/15/ 2015 7/ 15/ 2015 Shredder, heavy duty 
ITMU 

238-10 
Office Equipment· 2 unit 

ITMU Small Value 7/6/ 2015 7/6/2015 i Automatic Voltage Regulator 

238-10 
I Office Equipment - 1 unit 

HRU Small Value 7/6/2015 7/6/2015 Ulminating Machine 

238·10 
Office Equipment- 2 unit Air ITMU (Server 

Small Value ongoing 
Filter/ Purifier Room) 

238-10 
Office Equipment - 3 unit Air BAS & Supply 

Small Value ongoing 
Purifier Storage Room 

238-10 
Office Equipment- 1 unit Aircon, 

Abra LHIO Small Value l ongoing 
window type, Inverter, 1.5HP 

I 

238·10 
Office Equipment· 1 unit Aircon, 

Kalinga LHIO Small Value on going 
floor mounted, 3HP 

238·10 
Office Equipment - 1 uOII Aircon, 

Jfugao LHIO Small Value on going 
split type, 1.5HP 

238·10 
Office Equipment · 3 unit Aircon, ITMU, Collection, 

Small Value on going 
split type, 1.5HP Apayao PBC 

238·10 
Office Equipment· 1 unit Aircon, 

Kalinga LHIO Small Value on going 
w indow type, 2.5HP 

238·10 
Office Equipment - 1 unit 

ASS Small Value on going 
Biometric 

238-10 
Office Equipment- 1 unit Bundy 

ASS Small Value ongoing 
Clock 

238·10 
Office Equipment • 1 unit Camera, 

fOD Small Value on going 
compact, digital 

238-10 
Office Equipment- 1 unit folding 

FMS Small Value ongoing 
Machine ~ ( ( I ' 

238-10 
Office Equipment • 1 unit Hospital 

HCDMO (Clinic) Small Value on going 
Dressing Cart 

238-10 
Office Equipment - 1 unit 

HCDMO (Clinic) Small Value ongoing 
St retcher 

furniture & FIXture - 4 unit 
ORVP & Planning I Small Value I 6/ 8/ 2015 6/8/ 2015 239-00 

Storage Cabinet 

Furniture & Fixture - 7 unit Filing I 
3/ 27/2015 

I 
8/ 12/ 2015 8/ 12/2015 239-00 

Cabinet, 4-drawer 
FMS & Abra LHJO I Small Value 3/ 192015 



I Acrual Procurement Activity 
' Procurement Project PMO/ Mode of 

PAP Code 
Name End user Proc urement 

Prc-Proc Ads/ Pos t Pre-bid Eligibility S11b/Opening Bid Post - N otice of Cootr.lCI N o tice to Delive ry Acceptance 

Coni. ITB Conf. Check of Bids Eval11atio n Qual Aw.lrd Signing Proceed Completion T11r0-onr 

239-00 
Furniture & Fixture- 2 umt Mobile 

Kalinga LHIO Small Value I 8/ 12/2015 8/ 12/ 2015 
Cabinet 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture· 4 unit Steel 

Abra LHIO Small Value 8/ 12/201S 8/ 12/ 2015 
Rack 

Furniture & Fixture - 10 unit 
FMS, Planning & 

239-00 Cabinet, wooden w/ glass sliding Small Value 12/10/ 2015 on going 

door 
AJILHIOs 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit 

Small Value on-going 
Cabinet, wooden, 3 layers 

FOO 

239.00 
Furnitwe & Fixture ·1 unit Coffee 

Benguet LHIO Small Value on-going 
Rack 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture • 6 unit Filing 

SOOs ollHIOs Small Value 12/ 10/2015 on'i!oing 
Cabinet w/ Vault 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture ·1 unit 

PRO·CAR Clinic Small Value on-going 
Portable Rollaway Bed 

Furniture & Fixture • 2 unit Warehouse & Mt. 
Small Value on-going 239-00 

ladder, 5', A-type Prov. LHIO 

239-00 
Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit Mobile 

Storage Compactor 
Records Unit Small Value 12/10/ 2015 on-going 

Furniture & Fixture - 5 unit 
Abra LHIO; PRMC Small Value 12/ 10/ 2015 on-going 239.00 

Storage Cabinet 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture- 1 unit Table, 

Apayao PBC Small Value on-going 
Conference 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture ·1 unit 

Warehouse Small Value on-going 
Trolley/Cart, big. heavy duty 

239.00 
Furniture & Fixture • 1 unit Table , 

Records unit Small Value on-going 
Conference 

238·20 
IT Equipment - 2 unit HOD, SATA 

Hard Disk, l,ow capadty 
ITMU Small Value 7/8/2015 7/8/ 2015 

238·20 IT Equipment • 2 unit Card Reader ITMU, PAU Small Value 7/8/2015 7/ 8/ 2015 

' ~ 

' Abra, Apayao, 
\ 

I 

. 
IT Equipment · 6 unit 

Kalinga, lfugao, 
238-20 Communication Device, Pocket Small Value 7/ 8/ 2015 7/8/ 2015 

Wifi 
Mt. Prov., 

Benguet lHIOs 

238-20 
IT Equipment - 1 unit Adaptor for 

FOO Small Value on going 
laptop 

IT Equipment · 2 set CCTV, 1 dvr WarehollSe and 
Small Value 12/ 10/2015 on going 238-20 

w/ 3 cameres & monitor Buguias PBC r Equipment· 12 unit ASS & PRO-CAR 
Small Value 112/ 10/2015 on going 238-20 

HOO<external, high capadty lHIOs 



PMO/ 
Acrual Procurement A ctivity 

PAP Code 
Procurement P roject Mode of 

Notice to I Delivery I Acceptance Name Enduser Procuremen t Prc-Proc Ads/Post Pre-bid I Eligibility I Sub/ Opening Bid I Post- Notice o f I Cootnct 

Co of. ITB Co of. Check of Bids Evaluation Qual Award Signing Proceed Completion 1 Turn-<»-er 

IT Equipment - 11 unit Printer, 
fUD, HLUMU, 

238-20 
Inkjet, colored 

MSO and alllHIOs Small Value 12/10/ 2015 on going 
& PBC< 

fUU, HLUMU, 
238-20 IT Equipment -8 unit Scanner MSD and all lHIOs Small Value 12/ 10/ 2015 ongoing 

& PBC< 

2965460 
Procurement of 1 Lot Regular IT PRO-CAR and 

Public Bidding 12/3/2014 12/10/2014 12/23/2014 12/ 23/ 2014 12/23/2014 
12/23/2014· 

1/14/2015 2/11/2015 2/13/2015 Equipment for 2014 LHIOs 01/08/2015 

14-12-024 
Procurement of 1 Lot IT Network PRO-CAR and 

Public Bidding 12/ 3/2014 12/ 10/2014 12/23/2014 12/ 23/ 2014 12/23/2014 
12/ 23/2014-

1/14/2015 2/11/2015 2/13/2015 Device and IT Equipment LHIOs 01/08/2015 

Procurement of Leasehold PRO-CAR, K•linga 
01/20/2015-2995327 Improvement of PRO-CAR, Apayao lHIO and Apayao Public Bidding 12/ 30/2014 1/7/2015 1/19/2015 1/19/2015 1/19/2015 1/27/2015 2/11/2015 2/13/2015 

PBC and Kalinga LHIO PBC 01/26/2015 

Procurement of Lease of Venue Lease of Privately 
2/21/20150- 03/02/2015-

for the conduct of PRO-CAR PRO-CAR Owned Real Estate N/A 
03/02/2015 

N/A 3/2/2015 3/2/2015 3/2/2015 
03/04/2015 

3/4/2015 3/5/2015 
Employees Day and Venue 

Procurement of lease of Venue 1Phi1Health Central Lease of Privately 
03/23/ 2015- 03/31/2013-

for the conduct of Training for Office through Owned Real Estate N/A 
03/30/2015 

N/A 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 
04/01/2015 

4/1/2015 4/6/2015 
Trainers on TseKap Package PRO-CAR and Venue 

Procurement of lease of Venue 
Lease of Privately I 04/01/2015-for the Quality Management 

PRO-CAR Owned Real Estate N/ A N/A 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 
04/08/2015-

4/14/2015 4/15/2015 
1 Systems Tra1ning for PRO-CAR 

and Venue I 04/08/2015 04/13/2015 
Employees 

Procurement of Lease of Venue 
PhiiHealth Central Lease of Privately 

104/23/2015-for the Phil Health Accounts 
Office through Owned Real Estate N/A N/A 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 

04/30/2015-
5/ 4/2015 5/5/2015 

Management Strategy Forum for 
PRO-CAR and Venue 

04/29/2015 05/04/2015 
Area 1 

I 

Procurement of Lease of Venue 
Phil Health Central lease of Privately I 05/11/2018-for the Conduct of Workshop on 
Office through Owned Real Estate N/A N/A 5/18/2015 5/18/2015 5/18/2015 

05/18/2015-
5/22/2015 5/26/2015 

the Implementation Review of All 
PRO-CAR and Venue 

05/18/2015 05/20/2015 
Case Rates 

.; 
Procurement of Lease of Venue Lease of Privately 

08/20/2015 08/27/2015 -
for the Orientation of Casual PRO-CAR Owned Real Estate N/A 

08/27/2015 
N/A 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 

08/28/2015 
8/ 28/ 2015 8/28/2015 9/2/2015 09/02-03/ 2015 

Employees of PRO-CAR and Venue 
I 

Procurement of Lease of Venue 
Lease of Privately 

10/27/2015 j 
I 

11/06/2015 -
for Ronda Probinsya 

Abra LHIO Owned Real Estate N/A 
11/03/2015 

N/A 11/3/2015 11/3/2015 11/3/2015 
11/ 10/ 2015 

11/13/2015 Ongoing 12/ 15/2015 
and Venue 

Procurement of Lease of Venue 
Lease of Privately I 

10/27/2015 J 11/06/2015 . , 
Apayao LHIO Owned Real Estate 

1 

N/ A N/A 11/3/2015 11/3/2015 11/3/2015 11/23/2015 11/ 24/2015 12/10/2015 
for Ronda Probinsya 

and Venue 111/03/2015 1 I I 11/10/2015 



PAP Code 

3416861 

3437255 

3492180 

35157U 

3526396 

Prepared by: 

Procure ment Pro ject PMO/ M ode o f 

Name End user Procurement 

Procurem~t of Lease of Venue 
Lease of Privately 

for Ronda Probonsya 
Baguio LHIO Owned Real Estate 

andV~ue 

Procurement of lease of Venue 
least of Privately 

for Ronda Probinsya 
Benguet Owned Real Estate 

and Venue 

Procurem~t of lease of V~ue 
Lease of Privately 

for Ronda Probonsya 
lfugao Owned Real Estate 

and Venue 

Procurement of lease of Venue 
lease of Privately 

for Ronda Probinsya 
Kallnga Owned Real Estate 

and Venue 

Procurement of lease of Venue 
lease of Privately 

for Ronda Probinsya 
Mt. Province Owned Real Estate 

and Venue 

Procurement of 1 lot Office 
PRC>-CA.R Public Bidding 

Tables and Chairs 

Procurement of 1lot Office 
PRC>-CA.R Public Bidding 

Tables and Chairs 

Nrgolia ted 

Procurem~t of 1lot Office 
PRC>-CA.R 

Procurement 
Tables and Chairs (After Two Fill led 

BiddiRR$) 

Procurement of 1lot IT 
PRO-CAR Public Bidding 

Equipment 

Procurem~t of 1 Lot Intranet 
SaguiolHIO Public Bidding 

Service PrOVIder for Baguoo LHIO 

Procurement of Venue for the 
Lease of Privately 

Conduct of Employer's Forum 
PRO-CAR Owned Real Estate 

and Venue 

Procurem~t of Lease of venue lease of Priviltely 

for the Conduct of PRC>-CA.R PRC>-CA.R Owned Real Estate 

Internal Team Building and Venue 

Procurement of lease of Venue 
PhiiHealth Central lease of Privately 

Office through Owned Real Estate 
for the SHinES I PRC>-CA.R and Venue 

CONCEPCION S. MANOIIT 

HRM,AII 

P~·Proc Ads/Post P~·bid Eligibility 

Conf. ITB Coni. Check 

10/27/ 2015 
N/A 

ll/03/2015 
N/A ll/3/2015 

N/A 
10/27/2015 j 
11/03/ 2015 

N/A 11/3/ 2015 

10/ 27/ 2015 . 
N/A 

11/03/2015 
N/A 11/3/ 2015 

10/27/2015 

11/03/ 2015 
N/A 11/3/ 2015 

10/27/ 2015 
N/A 

11/03/ 2015 
N/ A 11/3/2015 

9/ 17/ 2015 
09/ 19/ 2015 

N/A N/ A 
09/28/ 2015 

9/ 17/ 2015 
10/1/2015 . 

N/ A N/ A 
10/8/2015 

110/27/ 2015 
9/ 17/2015 11/03/2015 10/ 23/2015 11/3/ 2015 

11/06/2015 
11/18/ 2015 12/4/2015 

12/04/2015 

I 
11/11/2015 

N/A 
11/18/ 2015 

10/ 16/2015 
1 10/ 26/2015 N/A 

10/ 24/ 2015 
N/A 

. 
10/ 16/ 2015· 

N/A 
10/22/2015 1 

N/ A 10/23/2015 

N/A 11/ 09/2015 1 
11/17/2015 

N/A 11/18/ 2015 I 

Recommending Approval: 

~ON 
BAC Cha irpe rson 

Sub / Opening 
o f Bids 

ll/3/2015 

11/ 3/2015 

11/3/ 2015 

11/3/ 2015 

11/3/ 2015 

9/28/2015 

10/8/2015 

11/3/2015 

12/4/2015 

11/18/2015 

10/ 26/ 2015 

10/ 23/2015 

11/ 18/ 2015 

Acrual Procurement Activity 

Bid Post· Notice o f 

Evaluation Qual Award 

11/06/2015. 
ll/3/2015 

1.1/ 10/ 2015 
11/13/2015 

11/06/ 2015. 
11/3/ 2015 

11/10/ 2015 
11/13/2015 

11/06/2015. 
11/3/ 2015 

11/10/ 2015 
11/24/ 2015 

11/06/ 2015 • 
11/3/2015 

11/10/2015 
11/24/ 2015 

11/06/ 2015 • 
11/ 3/2015 

11/10/ 2015 
11/13/ 2015 

N/A N/A N/A 

N/A N/A N/ A 

11/3/2015 
U/4/ 2015· 

11/13/2015 
11/6/2015 

12/4/2015 Ongoing 

N/ A N/A 

10/27/2015 . 
10/ 26/ 2015 

11/02/2015 
11/4/2015 

10/23/2015 . 
10/23/ 2015 I 10121/2015 

U /4/2015 

11/18/2015 1 11/18/ 2015· 
11/20/ 2015 

11/23/ 2015 

Approved by: 

0l~ZA~NOEZ, MD 
Regional VIce President 

Contrac t I N otice to Delivery A cceptance 

Signing Procted Com pletion Tum-ovtr 

ll/13/ 2015 ll/17/2015 

1 11/13/ 2015 11/20/ 2015 

ll/26/2015 

I 
U /6/2015 

I 
I 

U/3/2015 U /8/2015 

ll/24/2015 1 12/2/2015 

N/A N/A N/A N/A 

N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Ongoing 

I 

ll/6/ 2015 I N/A 11/19/ 2015 

flfS/2015/2~ N/ A 11/19/2015 

12/1/2015 I N/ A 12/3/2015 



P rocure ment Source o f 

P rog.-.un P rojec t RIV/ PR ABC Fund 

Numbcr/s Number 

PR15-0Hl01, I 
Regular Offia Supplies 002,020,028,030,031,03 2015COB 

3;105;106;108 

PR15-0Hl03, 

Regular Office Supplies 007,010,011,013,014,02 2015 COB 

2,023,032;107 

Regular Office Supplies PRlS-02.005; 029 2015 COB 

Regular Office Sup piles PR15~73 I 2015 COB 

ACCO<Jntable Forms I P-15.013;054;055 2015 COB I 
Ml!dical, ~tal & Lab 

Supplies 
PR15.02.005 2015 COB 

Drugs & Medicines Expe nses 
PRl S-01-004; 

2015 COB 
15-09-<178 

IT Supplies PR 15-01.001, 002; 158 2015 COB 

IT Supplies I PR 15-01.003, 032;107 2015 COB 

-
IT Supplies PR15-03-006; lOS 2015 COB 

Offke Equipment • 1 unit I 
Home Appliance, Refrigerator 

RIV 15415 2015 COB I 
Office Equipment - 3 unit Fan, 

RiV 15-032 I I 2015 COB 
• Electric Fan, w/ Stand 

Office Equipment • 1 unit 

I RJV 15411 I 2015 COB 
Vacuum Cleaner I 

Offke Equipment - 1 unit 

Sound System, Public Address RIV 15-036 2015 COB 

System 

Office Equipment - 3 unit I 
Speaker, Cradle speaker RIV 15411 & 032 2015 COB 

system 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 

I Camera, d.g1tal, SLR k1t w/lens 
RIV P-15411 2015 COB 

R~public of lh~ Philippines 

Philippine Health Insurance Corporation 
PHILHEALTH REGIONAL OFFICE · CORDILLERA ADMINISTRATIVE REGION 

SN Orien!al Baguio Traders Bldg. , No. 19 Leonard Wood Road, Baguio City 

Tel. No. (074) 444-9862/ 444-8361 / 446.0071 / 444-5345 (TIF) I Call Ceno:r (02) 441 -7442 

www ohilh~alih.rov oh 

BAC-GOODS AND SERVICES 

Procurement Monitoring Report as of December 31, 2015 

ABC (PbP) Cooc:nct Cost (Pb.P) 

Total I MOOE co I Total 

I MOOE co 

I 
1,493,214.50 

1, 723,261.00 1,723,261.00 1,614,179.90 

U0,965.40 

19,043.00 19,043.00 8,415.80 8,415.80 

U,220.00 U ,220.00 U ,218.50 12,218.50 

541,559.00 541,559.00 165,300.00 165,300.00 

15,162.00 15,162.00 I 4,528.00 4,528.00 

83,346.S7 83,346.S7 80,228.40 80,228.40 

1,455,021.20 

2, 725,333.00 2,725,333.00 2,232, 788.20 9,767.00 

I 768,000.00 

11,544.50 T 11,544.50 11,500.00 11,500.00 

3,294.'f 3,294.00 3,270.00 3,270..00 

I ' 
6,600.00 6,600.00 6,490.00 6,490.00 

27,500.00 27,500.00 27,00000 27,000.00 

I I I 
I I I 

15,592 50 15,592.50 13,050.00 13,05000 

I 

I I 
28,609.00 1 32,989 00 32,989.00 28,609 00 

I NAl\1E OF Submits bid proposal AMOUNT 

BIDDERS 
during the bid opening o f 

YES I NO Bid d ocume nt 

I 

! 
I 

I i 

I 
I 
I I 

I 

I 
I 

I I 

I 

I 

I I 
I I 



P rocwement Source of ABC (PbP) Contract Cost (PbP) NAME OF Submits bid p roposal AMOU NT 

Program P roject RIV/ PR ABC F und 
BIDDERS 

during the bid opening of 
Total MOOE co T otal MOOE co I Number/s Number YES NO Bid document 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 
RIV P-15-046 2015 COB 60,000.00 60,000.00 41,950.00 41,950.00 I I Paper Shredder, heavy duty 

Office Equipment - 5 un1t RIV P-15-

Paper Shredder, heavy duty 041;0430;44;047 
2015 COB 91,3SS.OO 91.355.00 46,000.00 46,000.00 

I 

Office Equipment - 2 unit 
RIV P-15-041 2015 COB 5,939.46 5,939.46 3,300.00 3,300.00 

Automatic Voltage Regulator I 
Office Equipment - 1 unit 

RIV P-15-044 2015 COB 12,172.60 12,172.60 5,900.00 5,900.00 
laminating Machine 

Office Equipment- 2 unit Air 
15-12-140 2015 COB 20,000.00 20,000.00 

Filter/ Purifier 

Office Equipment - 3 unit Air 
15-12-143 & 148 2015 COB 41,400.00 41,400.00 I Purifier 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 

2015 COB l I Aircon, window type, 15-12-149 25,000.00 25,000.00 

inverter, 1.5 H P 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 
15-12-154 2015 COB 104,000.00 104,000.00 I Aircon, Roor mounted, 3HP 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 
15-12-153 2015 COB 61,600.00 61,600.00 

Aircon, split type, 1.5HP 

Office Equipment - 3 unit 
15-12-140;146;150 2015COB 246,840.00 246,840.00 

Aircon, split type, l.SHP 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 
15-12-154 2015COB 41,800.00 41,800.00 

Aircon, window type, 2.5HP 

OffiCe Equipment - 1 unit 
15-12-143 

Biometric 
2015 COB 20,900.00 20,900.00 

Office Equipment - 1 umt 

Bundy Clock 
15-12-143 2015 COB 10,000.00 10,000.00 I 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 
15-12-145 2015 COB 15,997.80 15,997.80 

Camera, compact, digita l 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 
15-12-142 2015 COB 100,000.00 100,000.00 I 

Folding Machine { { ~ 
l 

Office Equipment - 1 umt 

Hospital Dressing Cart 
15-12-147 2015COB 15,420.00 

I 
15,420.00 

Office Equipment - 1 unit 

Stretcher 
15-12-147 2015 COB 23,650.00 23,650.00 

Furniture & Fixture - 4 unit 

Storage Cabinet 
RIV 15-039 & 040 2015 COB I 44,000.00 I 44,000.00 44,000.00 44,000.00 I 

Furniture & Fil<ture - 7 unit 
I 

62.860.00 1 I Filing Cabinet, 4-drawer 
RIV P-15-043;044;047; 2015 COB I 80,080.00 I 80,080.00 62,860.00 



Procurement Source o f ABC (PbP) I Contract Cost (PhP) NAME OF S11bmits bid proposal AMOUNT 

Prognm Project RIV/ PR ABC F~md ! I BIDDE RS 
during tbe bid o pening of 

Total MOOE co Total MOOE co 
Number/a Num ber YES NO Bid docume nt 

Furniture & Fixture - 2 unit 

I Mobile Cabinet 
RIV P-15-037 2015 COB 13,120.00 13,120.00 5,960.00 5,960.00 I I 

Furnitu re & Fixture - 4 unit 
RIV P-15-032 2015 COB 

Steel Rack 
38,720.00 38,720.00 30.720.00 1 30,720.00 

Furniture & Fixture - 10 unit 

Cabinet, wooden w/ glass 15·12-142;149-155 2015 COB 220,000.00 220,000.00 
sliding door 

Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit 

Cabinet, wooden, 3 layers 
1S-l2-145 2015 COB 15,000.00 15,000.00 

Furniture & Fixture- 1 un it 
15-12-152 2015 COB 3,500.00 3,500.00 

Coffee Rack 

Furniture & Fixture - 6 unit 15-12-149; 150;152 TO 
2015 COB 78,000.00 78,000.00 I Filing Cabinet w/ Vault 155 

Furniture & FIXture - 1 unit 
15-12-147 

Portable Roll away Bed 
2015 COB 6,000.00 6,000.00 

Furniture & Fixture - 2 unit 
15-12-143 &155 2015 COB 16,000.00 

Ladder, 5', A-type 
16,000.00 

Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit 
15-12-143 2015 COB 280,000.00 280,000.00 

Mobile Storage Compactor 

Furniture & Fixture - 5 unit 
15-12-149 & 156 2015 COB 55,000.00 55,000.00 

Storaae Cabinet 

Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit 
15-12-150 2015COB 20,000.00 20,000.00 

Table, Conference I 
Furniture & Fixture -1 unit 

15-12-143 2015 COB 8,000.00 8,000.00 
Trol ley/Cart, big. heavy duty 

Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit 
15-12-143 2015 COB 4,500.00 4,500.00 

Table, Conference 

IT Equipment - 2 unit HOD, 
RiV P-15-020 2015 COB 9,000.00 9,000.00 I 5,100.00 I S,100.00 I SATA Hard Disk, l,ow capacity 

IT Equipment - 2 unit Card 
RIV P-15-020 2015 COB 5,000.00 5,000.00 420.00 I 420.00 I Reader 

' 1 ' IT Equipment - 6 unit 
RIV P-15-023;025;027-

Communication Device, 2015COB 29,007.00 29,007.00 9,510.00 

l 
9,510.00 

Pocket Will 
030 

IT Equipment - 1 unit Adaptor I I 

for Laptop 
15-10-14AA 2015 COB 780.00 780.00 

IT Equipment - 2 set CCTV, 1 
15-12-143 & 152 I 2015 COB 50,000.00 I 50,000.00 

dvr w/ 3 came res & monitor 

IT Equipment- 12 unit 
15-12-143 & 149 to 155 I 2015 COB I 96,000.00 i 96,000.00 I I I HOD<external, high capacity 



Procun:me nt Source o f ABC (PhP) Contnct Cost (PbP) NAME OF Submits bid proposal AMOUNT 

P rogram Project RIV/ PR ABC Fund 

I 
BIDDERS during tbe bid opening o f 

Total MOOE co Total MOOE co I N umbcr/s Number YES NO Bid docume nt 

IT Equipment · 11 unot Pronter, 15-12-144, 145; 147; 
2015COB 110,000.00 I I I I Inkjet, colored 149 to 155 

110,000.00 

IT Equipment · 8 uno! Scanner 
15-12-144; 145; 

2015COB 200,000.00 200,000.00 
147;152 tal 55 

Masangkay 
Procurement of 1 Lot Regular 

P-14-119 COB 3,128,000.00 3,U8,000.00 2,848,912.00 
Computor Center, 

X 4,000.00 IT Equipment for 2014 Unk Network 
Solutions Inc 

Procurement of 1lot IT 
Ma.sangkay 

Network Device and IT P-14-144 COB 1,470,000.00 1,4 70,000..00 1.290.484.00 I X 2,000.00 
Equipment 

Computer Center 

Procurement of leasehold 
Mountaon Horuon 

Improvement of PRO-CAR, I J-14-145 COB 1,314,197.42 1,314,197.42 1,309,884.41 X 2,000.00 
Apayao PBC and Kallnga lHIO 

Builders 

El Cielito Inn, Pooten 
Procurement of lease of . 

Resort, Riverview 

Venue for the conduct of PRO.. P-15.{116 COB 128,072.00 128,072.00 117,000.00 117,000.00 waterpatic, Palm X N/A 
CAR Employees Day Grove Mounta111 

I I Resort . .. 
1 Procurement at Lease 01 

NewTown Piau 
Venue for the conduct of 
Traonlng for Trainers on 

J-15.{151 COB 457,076.47 457,076.47 402,000.00 402,000.00 Hotel, Forest lodge, X N/A 

ITseKao Packaae 
Le Monet 

Procurement of lease of 
Venue for the Quality 

New Town Plaza 
Management Systems P-15.{152 COB 334,400.00 334,400.00 334,400.00 334,400.00 

Hotel, 
X N/A 

Training for PRO-CAR 
Emolovees 

Procurement of lease of 
Chalet Baguio, Hotel 

Venue for the PhoiHealth 
COB 247,690.00 247,690.00 198,270.00 198,270.00 Elizabeth, Newtown X N/A 

Accounts Management Plaza Hotel 
Strategy Forum for Area 1 

rocurement o r Lease or 
The Manor at Camp 

Venue for the Conduct of John Hay, Newtown 
Workshop on the 15.{)5.{)17A COB 325.674.03 325,674.03 289,582.08 289,582.08 

Plaza Hotel, Baguio 
X N/A 

Implementation Review of All 
Crown legacy 

(,..,.Rat'"' -1 ' I Palm GrooYe Resort, 
Procurement of lease of 

Rivervoew Par\ Ason 
Venue for the Orientation of ~-059 COB 84,199.80 84,199 80 79,05000 79,050.00 X N/ A 

Casual Employees of PRO-<AR I I 
Hotspf\ng Pooten 

I Resort 

Procurement of lease of I I I Mang !nasal, 

15-10..118A 

I 
COB 28,080.00 28,080 00 28.080.00 I 28,080.00 Geofrey Catering, None 

Venue for Ronda Probinsya I Plaoda G. Barcena 

Arlydz Restaurant 

Procurement of lease of 
15-10-118A 

I 
COB 18,360.00 I 18,360.00 17.00000 I 17,000.00 

and Catering, 
X None 

Venue for Ronda Probinsya Apayao Restaurant 
ilnd Hot Miki RJ 



Procuzement 

Prog ram Project 

Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for Ronda Probinsya 

Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for Ronda Probinsya 

Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for Ronda Probinsya 

Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for Ronda Probincya 

Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for Ronda Problnsya 

Procurement of 1 Lot Office 
Tables and Chairs 

Procurement of 1 Lot Office 
Tables and Chairs 

Procurement of 1 Lot Office 
Tables and Chairs 

Procurement of 1 Lot IT 
Equipment 

Procurement of 1 Lot Intranet 
Service Provider for Baguio 
LHIO 

Procurement of Venue for the 
Conduct of Employer's Forum 

I 
Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for the Conduct of PRO 
CAR Internal Team Building 

Procurement of Lease of 
Venue for the SHinES 

Prepared by: 

Source o f 

RIV/ PR ABC Fund 

Nurober/ s Number 

l5-10-118A COB 

15-10-118A COB 

15-10-llSA COB 

15-10-ll8A COB 

15-10-ll8A COB 

15-{)9.076 COB 

15-{)9.076 COB 

lS-{)9.076 COB 

15-10-117 COB 

15-11-123 COB 

15-10-115 COB 

15-10-112 COB 

15·11-126 COB 

CONCEPCION S. MANOIIT 

HRMAII 

ABC (PhP) 

r 
T otal MOOE co 

I 

I 
26,460.00 26,460.00 

I 
24,300.00 24,300.00 

I 

21,060.00 21,060.00 

27,000.00 27,000.00 

19,440.00 19,440.00 

588,148.00 568,148.00 

588,148.00 568,148.00 

568,148.00 588,148.00 

5,586,500.00 5,586,500.00 

15,000.00 15,000.00 

66,000.00 66,000.00 

l 

307,200.00 307,200.00 

54,127.50 54.127.50 I 
Recommending Approval: 

~ON 
BAC Chairperson 

ConttactCost(PhP) NAME OF Submits bid proposal AMOUNT 

BIDDERS during lhe bid opening of 
To tal MOOE co 

YES I NO Bid document 

Bagu<o Crown 
Legacy Hotel, 

24,500.00 24,500.00 X None 
Newtown Plaza 

Hotel Prince Plaza 
KJR fasttood, Ebais 
Cafe and Pastry, 

24,000.00 24,000.00 
Vizcos Restaurant/0 

X None 

and LGarden 
Halfway Lodge and 
Restaurant, Banaue 

14,430.00 14,430.00 
Ethnic Village. 

X None 

Sanafe Lod11e 
Grand Zion Garden 

Resort and Hotel Inc, 
27,000.00 27,000.00 

Tampco Inn and 
X None 

Restaurant Golden 
Archog Hotel and 
Restaurant, Chico 

14,400.00 14,400.00 
Terrace Resto and 

X None 

Inn. Samold Vallev 

N/A No Bidders 2,000.00 

N/A N/A No Bidders 2,000.00 

Intelligent Depot, 

N/A N/A Real form Furniture X None 
and Shop, K Serv~co 

Masangkay 
Computer Center. 

X 6,000.00 
Del International, 
Taipan Marketing 

No Bidders N/A 

I ""•c coou n u.co, 

66,000.00 
Newtown Plaza 

N/A 66,000.00 
Hotel, Venus 

X 

' ~.: ••• ~ ,.JI8Qr~ •. 
224,000.00 224,000.00 

Cultural Village, Tree 
X N/ A 

Top Adventure 
Dl. .. 

I Newtown Plaza 

50,470.00 

I 
Hotel, Hotel X 

I 
N/A so.47o.oo I 

Elizabeth 

Approved by: 

cfe~ZA~NDEZ, MD 

Regional Vice President 



Procurement Code 

Progr.o.m Pro jec t PAP 

Regular Office Supplies 774-10 

Regular Office Supplies 774-10 

Regular Office Supplies 774-10 

Regular Office Supplies 774·10 

Accountable Forms 774-20 

Medical, Dental & Lab. Supplies 778-00 

Drugs & Medidnes Expenses 779-00 

IT Supplies 785-00 

IT Supplies 785-00 

IT Supplies 785-00 

Office Equipment- 1 unit Home 
238-10 

Appliance, Refrigerator 

Office Equipment - 3 unit Fan, Electric 
238-10 

Fan, w/ Stand ' 
Office Equipment - 1 unit Vacuum 

238-10 
Cleaner 

Office Equ1pment -1 unit Sound System, 
238-10 

Public Address System 

Office Equipment - 3 un1t Speaker, 
238-10 

Cradle speaker system 

Office Equipment • l unit Camera, 

I 238-10 
digital, SLR kit w/ lens 

Winning Bidde r 

Republic of the Philippines 

Philippine Health Insurance Corporation 
PHILHEAL TH REGIONAL OFFICE -CORDILLERA ADMINISTRATIVE REGION 

SN Oriental Baguio Traders Bldg, No. 19 leonard Wood Road, Baguio City 

Tel. No. (074) 444-9862/ 444-8361 / 44(H)371/ 444-5345 (TIF) I Call Center (02) 441-7442 

www.philheallh.gov.ph 

SAC-GOODS AND SERVICES 
Procurement Monitoring Report as of December 31, 2015 

~ 
-!_:-~~-:.: .. 

List o f Date o f Receipt oflnvitation 

Invited Pre-P roc Pre-bid Eligibility Sub/Open Bid 

Observers Conference Conference Check o f Bids Evaluation 

PS-OBM, Laser Mktg 

JC Com~ .• Panghol Ent. 

P5-DBM, Laser Mlctg 

National Printing Office I 
c/o C.O. 

P5-DBM 

PEA Drugs 

Ps-DBM 

Eagle Tech; Laser Mktg; 

X works Sales & Services 

ESM Enterprises 

I 
ESM Enterprises I ~ 

ESM Enterprises 

ESM Enterprises 

I 

ESM Enterprises 

I 
Mt. Studio I l I 

Remarks 

Post- (Expl:wUng Changes 

Qual. from the API') 

Change Mode of Procurement (BAC Res. II 
6, s. 2015) 

{ 



Procut"ement Code Lis t o f D a te o f R eceipt o f Invitatio n Re m a rks 

P rogram Pro jec t PAP Winning Bidder Invited Prc-P roc I Pre-bid Eligibility Sub/ O pen Bid Post- (Expbitung Clungcs 

O b s ervers Conference Confe re nce Check of Bids Evaluation Qual from the APP) 

Office Equipment • 1 unit Paper 
238-10 Laser Mktg 

Shredder, heavy duty 

Office Equipment - 5 unit Paper 
238-10 Laser Mktg I Shredder, heavy duty 

Office Equipment- 2 unit Automatic 
238-10 Laser Mktg 

Voltage Regulator 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Laminating 
238-10 Laser Mktg 

Machine 

Office Equipment - 2 unit Air 
238-10 

Filter/Purifier 

Office Equipme nt - 3 unit Air Purifier 238-10 

Office Equipment • 1 unit Aircon, 
238-10 

window type, inverter, 1.5HP 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Aircon, floor 
238-10 

mounted, 3HP 

Office Equopment - 1 unit Air con, split 
238-10 

type, 1.5HP 

Office Equipment - 3 unit Aircon. split 
238-10 

type, 1.5HP 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Aircon, Procurement on-going 

window type, 2.5HP 
238-10 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Biometric 238-10 

Office Equipment - 1 unot Bundy Clock 238-10 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Camera, 
238-10 

compact, digita l 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Folding 
238-10 

Machine { { 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Hospital 
238-10 

Dressing Cart 

Office Equipment - 1 unit Stretcher 238-10 

Furniture & Fixture- 4 unit Storage 
239-00 TriM Vault Specialist 

Cabinet 

Furniture & Fixture- 7 unit Filing 
239-00 See Manufacturing 

I Cabinet, 4-drawer 



Procurement Code List of D ate of R eceipt o f I nvitation R emarks 

Program Projec t PAP Winning Bidder Invited Pre-Proc I Pre-bid Eligibility Sub/Open Bid Post- (Explauung C!unges 

Observers Conference 
1 

Conference Check o f Bids Evaluation Q uaL from the tl PP) 

Furniture & Fixture - 2 unit Mobile 
239-00 See Manufacturing 

Cabinet 

Furniture & Fixture - 4 unit Steel Rack 239-00 See Manufacturing 

Furniture & Fixture - 10 unit Cabinet, 
239-00 

wooden w/ glass sliding door 

Furniture & Fixture- 1 unit Cabinet, 
239-00 

wooden, 3 layers 

Furniture & Fixture- 1 unit Coffee Rack 239-00 

Furniture & Fixture· 6 unit Fil ing 
239-00 

Cabinet w/ Vault 

Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit Portable 
239-00 

Rollaway Bed 

Furniture & Fixture - 2 unit Ladder, 5', A· 
239-00 

Procurement on-going 
type 

Furniture & Fixture · 1 unit Mobile 
239-00 

Storage Compactor 

Furniture & Fixture - 5 unit Storage 
239-00 

Cabinet 

Furniture & Fixture - 1 unit Table, 
239-00 

Conference 

Furniture & Foxture -1 unit Trolley/Cart, 
239-00 

big, heavy duty 

Furniture & Fixture- 1 unit Table, 
239-00 

Conference 

IT Equipment · 2 unit HOD, SATA Hard 
238-20 Baguio Office Systems & Solutions 

Disk, I, ow capacity 

IT Equipment - 2 unit Card Reader 238-20 Phllaser Marketing 

' 
\ I \ 

IT Equipment - 6 unit Communication 
238-20 Philaser Marketing I 

Device, Pocket Wifi 

IT Equipment - 1 unit Adaptor for 
238-20 I Laptop 

IT Equipment - 2 set CCTV, 1 dvr w/ 3 
238-20 I cameres & monitor 

IT Equipment - 12 unrt HOD<external, 

I 
238-20 Procurement on-going 

I I high capacity 



Proc urement Code List o f 
I 

Dare of Receipt o f Invitation Remarks 

Program Project PAP Winning Bidde r Invited I P~-Proc I P~-bid Eligibility I Sub/ Open Bid I Pou- (Expl:umng Clunges 

Observers Conference Conference Check of Bids Evaluation QuaL from lh< .\PP) 

IT Equipment - 11 unit Pr10ter, InkJet 
238-20 I I I colored 

IT Equipment - 8 unit Scanner 238-20 I I 
COA; Phil Chambers of I 

Procurement of 1 Lot Resular IT 
Masangkay Computer Center Commerce and U/10/2014 U/23/2014 U/23/2014 U/23/2014 Equipment for 2014 

lndustry;PICPA 

Procurement of 1 Lot IT Network Device 
COA; Phil Chambers of I Bidding documents was not posted In the 

and IT Equipment 
Masangkay Computer Center Commerce and 

I 
12/23/2014 12/23/2014 12/23/2014 PHILGEPS due to technical failure as 

lndustry;PICPA certified by the PHI LGEPS 

Procurement of leasehold ICOA; Phil Chambers of 
Improvement of PRO<AR, Apayao PBC Mounta10 Horizon 8uolders Commerce and l/7/2015 1/19/2015 1/19/2015 1/19/2015 

Posting of RfQ on the PHILGEPS WebSite os 

and Kalinga LHIO lndustry;PICPA 
not required 

I 

I 
Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 03/02/2015- Posting of RFQ In the PHILGEPS Websrte is 
conduct of PRO-CAR Employees Day 

Pooten Resort N/A 3/2/2015 3/2/2015 3/2/2015 
03/04/2015 not required 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 
03/31/2015- Fund Transfer. Postons of RFQ In the 

conduct of Training for Trainers on New Town Plaza Hotel N/A 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 3/31/2015 
04/01/2015 PHILGEPS website Is not required 

TseKap Package , 
I I 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 
04/08/2015- Posting of RFQ tn the PHILGEPS Website Is 

QuaGty Management Systems Training New Town Pl•za Hotel N/A 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 4/8/2015 
04/13/2015 not required 

for PRO-CAR Employees 

Procurement of lease of Venue for the 
04/30/2015- Fund Transfer. Postln& of RFQ in the 

PhtiHealth Accounts Management Chalet Bagulo N/A 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 4/30/2015 
OS/04/2015 PHILGEPS Website Is not reqUJred 

Strategy Forum for Area 1 
I ' 

Procurement of Lease of Venue for the 

I 
I I I 

Conduct of Workshop on the 

I 
05/18/2015· Fund Transfer. Posting of RFQ in the 

ImplementatiOn Review of All Case 
New Town Plaza Hotel N/A 

I 
5/18/2015 5/18/2015 5/18/2015 

OS/20/2015 PHILGEPS Websote is not requored 

Rates 

Procurement of lease of Venue f;r the I ' 
I 

Posting of RFQ In the PHILGEPS WebSite is 
Ason Hotsplrng Pooten Resort N/A 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 8/27/2015 

08/20/2015· 
Orientation of Casual Employees of PRO, 

08/27/2015 not required 
CAR I 
Procurement of Lease of Venue for 

I Plaoda G. Barcena I N/A 11/3/ 2015 11/3/2015 ll/3/2015 
11/06/2015 - Posting of RFQ on the PHILGEPS Websrte IS 

Ronda Probinsya I 11/10/2015 not required 

I 

I Procurement of Lease of Venue for I 

11/3/2015 1 11/06/2015- Posting of RFQ in the PHILGEPS WebSite os 
RJ Domonso Fish Farm Resort N/A 

I 
11/3/2015 11/3/2015 I not required Ronda Problnsya 11/10/2015 



ProcuJe ment 

Progr.am Project 

Procurement of lease of Venue for 
Ronda Probinsya 

Procurement of lease of Venue for 
Ronda Probonsya 

Procurement of lease of Venue for 
Ronda Problnsya 

Procurement of lease of Venue for 
Ronda Probinsya 

Procurement of lease of Venue for 

I Ronda Probinsya 

Procurement of 1lot Office Tables and 
Chairs 

Procurement of 1lot Office Tables and I 
Chairs 

Procurement of 1lot Office Tables and 
Chairs 

Procurement of 1 lot IT Equipment 

Procurement of 1 lot Intranet Service 
PrOV1der for Bacuio LHIO 

Procurement of Venue for the Conduct 
of Employer's Forum 

f-
Procurement of lease of Venue for the 
Conduct of PRO-CAR Internal Team 
Building 

Procurement of lease of Venue for the 
SH•nES 

Prepared by: 

Code 

PAP Winning Bidde r 

Baguio Crown legacy 

KJR Fastfood 

Halfway lodge and restaurant 

Golden Berries Hotel and 
Convention Center 

Choco Terrace Resto and Inn 

N/A 

N/A 

Intelligent Depot 

N/A 

Venus Parkview Hotel 

Tree Top Adventure Phollpplnes 

Hotel Elizabeth 

CONCEPCION S. MANDIIT 

HRMA II 

List of 

Invited Pre-Proc J Pre-bid 

Observers Conference Conference 

N/A 

N/A 

N/ A 

N/A 

N/A 

COA; Phil Chambers of 

Commerce and 9/ 17/2015 

lndustry;PICPA 

COA; Phil Chambers of 

Commerce and N/A N/A 

lndustry;PICPA 

ICOA; Phil Chambers of 
Commerce and N/ A 10/23/2015 

lndustry;PICPA 

COA; Phil Chambers of 

Commerce and 11/18/2015 

lndustry;PICPA 

COA; Phil Chambers of 

Commerce and 

lndustry;PICPA 

I N/ A N/A 

I 
N/ A 

N/ A N/A N/ A 

I I N/A N/ A N/ A 

I 
Recommend ong Approval: 

~N 
SAC Chairperson 

Date o f Receipt o f Invitation Remarks 

El.igtbility Sub/ Open Bid Post- {Expl;untng Clunges 

Ch.,ck o f Bid!l Ev:Uu:uioo Qual. fmm the API>) 

11/06/ 2015 - 1 Posting of RFQ In the PHilGEPS Webscte Is 
11/3/ 2015 11/3/2015 11/3/2015 

11/10/ 2015 not required 

I 
11/06/2015- I Posting of RFQ In the PHilGEPS Website is 

11/3/ 2015 11/3/2015 11/3/2015 
11/10/ 2015 not required 

11/3/ 2015 11/3/ 2015 11/3/ 2015 
11/06/2015 - Posting of RFQ In the PHilGEPS Website Is 

11/10/2015 not required 

11/3/ 2015 11/3/2015 11/3/ 2015 
11/06/ 2015 - Posting of RFQ In the PHilGEPS Website Is 

11/10/ 2015 not required 

11/3/2015 11/3/ 2015 11/3/2015 
11/06/ 2015 - Posting of RFQ In the PHilGEPS Website is 

ll/10/2015 not required 

No bids were received hence BAC dedare 
9/ 28/2015 9/28/2015 9/ 28/ 2015 N/A 

faolure of bidding. 

N/A 10/8/ 2015 

I 
N/A N/A 

No bids were received hence BAC dedare 
faolure of bodding. 

ll/• /2015 -
11/3/ 2015 11/3/ 2015 11/3/ 2015 

11/6/2015 
Ongoing contract slJnlng 

12/4/2015 12/4/ 2015 12/4/ 2015 Ongoing Ongoing post qualiflcatlon of LCB 

No bods were receoved hence BAC dedare 
failure of btddong. 

10/ 26/ 2015 10/ 26/2015 10/26/2015 
10/ 27/20J..S. !Posting of RFQ on the PHilGEPS Websote is 

11/02/ 2015 not required 

' 

10/ 23/2015 - PoSting of RFQ in the PHilGEPS Websote Is 
10/23/2015 10/23/ 2015 10/ 23/ 2015 

10/27/2015 not required 

ll/18/ 20J..S. I Fund Transfer. Posting of RFQ in the 
11/18/ 2015 11/18/ 2015 11/18/2015 

11/20/2015 PHILGEPS Websote is not requored 

Approved by: 




